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SURVEY RESULTS: STANDARD QUESTIONS

CURRENT ACTIVITY 

Tables 1 and 2 report the
most recent results of the St.
Cloud Area Business Outlook
Survey. Responses are from 57
area businesses that returned
the recent mailing in time to be
included in the report. Partici-
pating firms are representa-
tive of the diverse collection of
businesses in the area. They
include retail, manufacturing,
construction, financial, health
services and government en-
terprises, both small and large.
Survey responses are strictly
confidential. Written and oral
comments have not been at-
tributed to individual firms. 

Survey responses from
Table 1 are stronger than three
months ago (which is a normal
seasonal effect) but are gener-
ally weaker than those tallied
in last May’s survey. 

For example, while this
quarter’s diffusion index on
current business activity is a
marked improvement on its
negative reading last quarter,
the current value of 28.1 is well
below the 52.2 number record-
ed one year ago. This measure
is the lowest recorded in our
spring survey since May 2009
(when we were mired in a deep
local recession). Consistent
with what we see with the lead-
ing economic indicators series,
the current period has been
one of fairly sluggish local
growth — a theme that has
been witnessed in the national
data as well.

A diffusion index represents
the percentage of respondents
indicating an increase minus
the percentage indicating a
decrease in any given quarter.
For any given item, a positive
index usually indicates expand-
ing activity, while a negative
index implies declining condi-
tions.

The current-employment
and average-hours-worked
indexes are also improved
from last quarter but weaker
than one year ago. The capital
expenditures index is likewise
improved from February, but
unchanged from one year ago.
As can be seen in the accompa-
nying chart, after declining in
2014-15, the employee compen-
sation index continues to drift
upward. Fifty-one percent of
surveyed firms report higher
wages and salaries over the
past three months, and no
firms decreased wages. 

The area labor shortage
continues. Thirty-two percent
of surveyed firms experienced
increased worker shortages
this quarter, and only one firm
reported that it was less diffi-
cult attracting qualified work-
ers. The prices-received index
was slightly improved from
one quarter ago, but is well
below what was tallied in the
May 2015 survey. Seventy-two
percent of surveyed firms
report no change in prices

received over the past three
months.

Finally, firms’ perceptions of
national business activity con-
tinued to weaken over the re-
cent quarter. As can be seen in
the accompanying graph, the
national business activity index
has been sliding since peaking
in mid-2014. 

As always, firms were asked
to report any factors that are
affecting their business. These
comments include:

» Interest rate increases will
dramatically affect our profit-
ability. 

» The ongoing challenge
with hiring is primarily a result
of people not wanting to work.
There is way too much “free”
money/aid available. Potential
employees come right out and
say “why would I want to work
this hard, or 40 hours a week
when if I only work 20 hours a
week, I can get medical assis-
tance, housing assistance, food
assistance, etc. The “free” gov-
ernment money is ruining the
desire to work. 

» The way people buy is
changing at an accelerated
pace. They increasingly don’t
want or feel a need to talk to
anybody. 

» Health care is a huge issue
and will continue to be so. With
costs skyrocketing for health
care, wages increasing and
more social costs such as man-
dated paid time off for family
reasons, it will be more and
more difficult for smaller com-
panies to be profitable. 

» Obamacare. 
» Attracting workers with

good work ethic. 
» Regulatory rulemaking is

radically increasing costs. 
» I’m considering mentoring

a potential buyer to take over
the business. In order to be
successful (in my business),
you need a business and/or
banking background plus 30
months of on-the-job work
experience plus four-year de-
gree in business. 

FUTURE OUTLOOK

Table 2 reports the future
outlook for area businesses.
The six-month-ahead local
outlook remains strong. Half of
the categories in the table are
improved from last quarter and
several index values are only
marginally lower than they
were one year ago.

The index on future overall
business activity is 4.9 points
lower than it was last May, but
is well above where it stood in
the spring of 2008-09, when the
local economy was struggling. 

As indicated throughout this
report, the fundamental outlook
of surveyed firms is solid, but
not spectacular. Fifty-three
percent of firms expect in-
creased activity in six months,
and only 5 percent expect con-
ditions to worsen. This is a
strong reading for an economy

that is in a maturing expansion.
Similar to what is seen in the
St. Cloud Index of Leading
Economic Indicators, the fu-
ture business activity index
has been positive, but side-
ways, over the past three
years. Indeed, the quarter-to-
quarter variation of the index
has moderated as overall eco-
nomic uncertainty has waned.

The future employment
index is 19.2, which is well
below the number reported one
year ago. Sixty-five percent of
surveyed firms expect no
change in payrolls by Novem-
ber. With an April unemploy-
ment rate of 3.7 percent, rising
job vacancies in Central Min-
nesota, and continued difficul-
ty attracting qualified workers
(see below), area firms are
probably scaling back on their
expected hiring.

On a more positive note, the
area labor force expanded by
more than 2,000 people over
the past year, and this influx of
workers into the St. Cloud area
could help relieve some of the
strains of worker shortages.
The length of the workweek
index is little changed from
one year ago, and the planned
capital expenditures index is
only slightly lower than in May
2015. 

Future pricing conditions
appear to have weakened. For
example, the index on employ-
ee compensation is at its lowest
level in four years. Only 44
percent of surveyed firms
expect to pay higher wages in
November. One year ago, 51
percent of responding firms
were planning to pay rising
wages. 

The future-prices-received
index (see accompanying
graph) also dropped this quar-
ter. At 17.5, this index is at its
lowest in two years. After a
sluggish first half of the year,
IHS Economics — the fore-
casting service used by the
state of Minnesota — expects
the national economy to grow
at a 2.8 percent annualized rate
in the second half of 2016. This
forecast is consistent with the
responses of surveyed local
firms, who expect future na-
tional business activity to im-
prove. 

Finally, the index on expect-
ed difficulty attracting qual-
ified workers continues to be
elevated (see accompanying
chart). One-third of surveyed
firms are expecting more diffi-
culty attracting qualified work-
ers by November, and no firms
expect these difficulties to
decrease. 

SURVEY RESULTS FOR STANDARD QUESTIONS

The area labor force expanded by
more than 2,000 people over the
past year, adn this influx of
workers into the St. Cloud area
could help relieve some of the
strains of worker shortages.
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